
 

         What is vish yog? 

-By Tantra Siddha Maha Yogi Shastrishree Dr.Rupnathji 

Vish Yoga—Vish Yoga is formed when Saturn and Moon are together or when Sat aspects 
Moon.It is not a good yoga and person born under this yoga can do harm of persons represented 
by the house in which Saturn is placed. 

Shani and Chandra Yuti, generally considered as VISH YOGA (Poison Combination). and it 
does creates bad effect on Mother and her health particularly. But more importantly see the 4th 
House of the Native for Mother Son / Mother and Daughter relations. 

If Saturn is with Mars / Rahu in 4th House or making Kendra / Samsaptak Yoga like 4-10 
combination then there are much more chases that it will create rift between them. this normally 
leads to separation in the relation. A very painful patch for family in general. 

If Saturn and Moon are in Yuti where the distance between the Planets is less than 5 degrees then 
generally it gives worst effects. It can make the Native Emotionally and Mentally weak. 

Saturn poisons the Natural emotions of Moon causing lack of Expression and Emotions from 
Native 

These people are Hard working in Nature but success comes after the Age of 30-32. They 
generally land in to Service Industry after series of Failures. 

They are Strict in Discipline and make a Good Administrator. 

This Yuti gives Bad effects during Each Others Dasa and Antar Dasas. It reflects losses of the 
House where both the Planets are located. 

eg. If this Yuti is in 5th House then, Chandra Mahadasa with Shani Antardasa or vice versa will 
give Bad effect to Native, which leads to Failure in Exams, Sudden Change in Education 
Streams, Failure in Love Affair or Problem to Son/Daughter of Native. 
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Shani and Chandra Yuti, generally considered as VISH YOGA (Poison Combination). and it 
does creates bad effect on Mother and her health particularly. But more importantly see the 4th 
House of the Native for Mother Son / Mother and Daughter relations. 

If Saturn is with Mars / Rahu in 4th House or making Kendra / Samsaptak Yoga like 4-10 
combination then there are much more chaces that it will create rift between them. this normally 
leads to separation in the relation. A very painful patch for family in general. 

If Saturn and Moon are in Yuti where the distance between the Planets is less than 5 degrees then 
generally it gives worst effects. It can make the Native Emotionally and Mentally weak. Saturn 
poisons the Natural emotions of Moon causing lack of Expression and Emotions from Native 

These people are Hard working in Nature but success comes after the Age of 30-32. They 
generally land in to Service Industry after series of Failures. 

They are Strict in Discipline and make a Good Administrator. This Yuti gives Bad effects during 
Each Others Dasa and Antar Dasas. It reflects losses of the House where both the Planets are 
located. eg. If this Yuti is in 5th House then, Chandra Mahadasa with Shani Antardasa or vice 
versa will give Bad effect to Native, which leads to Failure in Exams, Sudden Change in 
Education Streams, Failure in Love Affair or Problem to Son/Daughter of Native. 

History of Shani dev 

Shani is a Deva and son of Surya (the Hindu Sun God) and his wife Chhaya (Shadow goddess) 
and hence also known as Chayyaputra. He is the elder 

brother of Yama, the Hindu God of death, who in some scriptures corresponds to the deliverance 
of justice. Interestingly, Surya’s two sons Shani an 

d Yama judge. Shani gives us the results of one’s deeds through one’s life through appropriate 
punishments and rewards; Yama grants the results of one’s deeds after death.[1] 

It is said that when Shani opened his eyes as a baby for the very first time, the sun went into an 
eclipse, which clearly denotes the impact of Shani on astrological charts. He is known as the 
greatest teacher. Shani dev is said to be very harmful to those who follow the path of betrayal, 
backstabbing and unjust revenge. He is known in Hindu scriptures as the greatest trouble giver as 
well as the greatest well wisher. He is depicted dark in colour, clothed in black; holding a sword, 
arrows and two daggers and variously mounted on a black crow 

Saturn Mahadasa and Shani Sade Sati 

If u want to remove ur life shani sade-sati or shani daaya or shani dosha evil & bad effect then 
yagya is the best way of the complete remove ur all shani dev evil effect .Because only worship 
or Totka shani planet related or wearing of shani dev gems & stone Ring can not remove shani 
dev evil effect it’s all method can gives only 25% to 30% relief shani evil effect because shani 
dev pleased of only mantra chanting and yagya when any person do shani dev shanti complete 
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process by chanting of mantra and 10 th part of chanting yagya then he get complete relief in his 
life because it’s will be give 100% positive effect whole life.According to Purana Donates all 
gems & stone shani related gives positive effect only 30% and all Totke shani related in humann 
life but not 100% positive only Mantra chanting & yagya has been 100% positive result in 
human life .when Sade-sati generally affects close relatives more than the native,During the 
period, the native has to undergo a testing time. Financially, the nativewill face more expenditure 
than inflow of income. Unnecessary financial problems may crop up. On health front also, it will 
effect the native. Lack of happiness, heavy tensions, eye problems, severe mental tension, 
unnecessary travels and at times, the native will face problems from the near relatives. influences 
the domestic front as well as the business front, During the second phase, th native’s family will 
be disturbed. He will undergo a long journey. He will be haunted by enemies and some of the 
natives may also get separated. Financial problems, social dishonor, lack of good friends and 
over all the native will be under severe stress, children, family, health, and physical suffering or 
may even indicate the death of the native. During this period, the native may lack of happiness. 
Loss of position is to be noted. Expenditure will be more than income. Inflow of money will be 
there but it is not suffice. The native may likely involve into unnecessary disputes and legal 
problems and health will be at task.  

So jatak is very necessary have to do complete remove of shani dev evil & negative effect of ur 
whole life by shanti yagya anushtaan of Maa Kali & Mahakaal ji and also get grace of GOD & 
Goddess Mahakaal & maa kali. 

To get benefic effects of sade-sati on health, mental peace, family happiness, finance & 
profession you are suggested for Maha-mrityunjaya 

& Maa Kali Japa. Recited following mantra for Min 125000 times. punarcharana, havanan, 
danam .it’s yagya has not sufficient have to do only 

one time of During period of sade-sati.Tantra Siddha Maha Yogi Shastrishree Dr.Rupnathji 
suggest that because it’s Kalyuga not a satyuga so due this according to Puran every 

mantra all God or Goddess will be effective when I do process 4 time due this every two year & 
six month when shani dev change phase 

then u have to do must need of shani yagya anushtaan with complete process.Because shani dev 
is very pleased to do yagya and mantra 

chanting when do any sadhak of Maa Kali ,Mahakaal shiv,Hanumaan,Kaal bhairv,Ganesh ji, and 
get very positive effect of which person who 

have to do yagya with complete process . 
You can also do your Shani dosh remedy yagya with Shri Guru Maharaaj ji stay at your 
home.know about more how to do remove ur Shani 

dosha yagya stay at ur home with Tantra Siddha Maha Yogi Shastrishree Dr.Rupnathji then u 
call know about process call +919954375906 
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SATURN MAHA DASHA EFFECT IN HUMAN LIFE— 

General Interpretations 

General effects which are felt during the Maha Dasha of the Saturn are as follows : 

• During the Maha Dasha of Saturn, some sort of authority in the city, village or society may be 
acquired. 

• One may become the leader of a lowly community. 

• Modesty, intelligence and knowledge is enhanced, inclination towards charity and skilled in arts 
and crafts. 

• Happiness may be gained from the acquisition of some ancient place. 

• One may be endowed with vehicles, clothes, gold and wealth. 

• Faith in God and interest in the construction of temples may prevail. 

• One may bring name and fame to the family. 

• Bliss of the family, increase of velour prevails and journeys are undertaken. 

• There may be gains from animals, camels, asses, goats, birds, old ladies and coarse grains. 

• Specific Interpretations: 

• Interpretations based on the condition of the planet and other influences in the birth chart and 
divisional charts are as follows: 

• During the Maha Dasha of Saturn , one may acquire the leadership of villages, cities and 
countries. 

• One’s father may be harmed or may expire and there may be enmity with friends. 

• During the Maha Dasha of Saturn, wealth, spouse, children, siblings and servants maybe 
harmed. 

• Bad feed maybe consumed and one may be defamed. 

• When Saturn is strong : 

• During the Maha Dasha of Saturn, there is an increase in happiness and fame. 

• Land may be lost and there may be opposition with servants, spouse, children and siblings. 
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• There may be fear of demotion or suspension and imprisonment by the government. 

• When Saturn is cruel, ‘ drashkanastha’, then 

• During the Maha Dasha of Saturn, there may be restlessness and fear of the powerful, thieves, 
fire and poison. 

• There may be opposition from relatives, domestic crisis and disagreement with workers. 

• There may be loss of wealth, fear from those in high places, mental unrest and ailments related 
to eyes and kidney may happen. 

• The spouse may suffer and elders in the family may be in pain. 

• State authority , honour and progress at work are foreseen. 

• Immovable assets, jewels, ornaments and wealth will be attained. 

• Vehicles, servants and objects of comfort will be attained. 

• Vehicles, servants and objects of comfort will be attained. 

• Sympathy in the mind is aroused. 

EFFECTS OF SUB PERIODS 

(ANTARDASHA): these are follwong Antar Dash under of Shani Mahadasha;— 

(1)-Saturn-saturn 

(2)-saturn-Mercury 

(3)-saturn-ketu 

(4)-saturn-venus 

(5)-saturn-sun 

(6)-saturn-Moon 

(7)-saturn-Mars 

(8)-saturn-Rahu 

(9)-Saturn-Jupiter 
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DASHA INTERPRETATION:- 

SATURN – SATURN 

Effects of Antar Dasha of Saturn Maha Dasha of Saturn 

• Physical lethargy and lack of enthusiasm prevails. 

• Obstacles at work, shortage of money, migration and indebtedness may occur. 

• Gastric problems, ailments and anger caused by price and jealousy are possible. 

• Kings and thieves may be responsible for destruction of wealth & prosperity. 

• One may become imprudent due to ones wife, there may be conflicts with children and many 
problems and hardships may prevail. 

• Effects like acquisition of a kingdom (attainment of a high position in government), happiness 
from wife and children, acquisition 

• of conveyances like elephants, gain of clothes , attainment of the position of a commander of 
the army by the beneficence of the 

• king, acquisition of cattle, villages, and land, etc. 

• Fear or danger from the king (government), getting inflicted with injuries with some weapon, 
bleeding gums, dysentery, etc., 

• will be the evil effects at the commencement of the Dasha. 

• There will be danger from thieves etc., going away from the homeland, mental agony, etc., in 
the middle portion of the Dasha. 

• The last part of the Dasha will yield beneficial result. 

SATURN – MERCURY 

Effects of Antar Dasha of Mercury Maha Dasha of Saturn 

• Status is attained in the royal court and promotion is attained. 

• Success in business & trade, and gain of wealth is possible. 

• One may derive pleasure from the company of scholars, interest in pious deeds increases and 
friends are beneficial. 

• Wife and sons cause happiness, vehicles, fame and name are attained, good fortune is 
enhanced. 
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• Cough and cold may cause physical pain. 

• Effects like reverence from the people, good reputation, gain of wealth , comforts of 
conveyances, etc. 

• Inclination towards performance of religious sacrifices ( Yagya’s), Raj Yog, bodily felicity, 
enthusiasm, well being in the family, pilgrimage to holy places, performance of religious rites, 
listening to Puranas ( Vedic scriptures), charities, availability of sweetish preparations, etc. 

• Acquisition of a kingdom ( attainment of a high position in Government), gain of wealth, 
headship of a village will be the effects at the commencement of the Dasha. 

• Affliction with diseases, failure in all ventures, anxiety and feeling of danger, etc. will be 
experienced in the middle portion and in the last part of the Dasha. 

• There will be physical distress. 

SATURN – KETU 

Effects of Antar Dasha of Ketu Maha Dasha of Saturn 

• Fear of imprisonment prevails and unhappy circumstances may arise. 

• Conflict with lowly and wicked people and separation from wife and son are possible. 

• Loss of wealth, bad dreams and fear of ailments caused by gas etc., are possible. 

• Evil effects like loss of position, dangers, poverty, distress, foreign journeys, etc. 

• There will be gain of wealth and enjoyment and bathing in holy places and visit to a sacred 
shrine at the commencement of the Antar Dasha. 

• Gain of physical strength and courage, religious thoughts, audience with the king (high 
dignitaries of government like: president, prime minister, governor, ministers), and all kinds of 
enjoyments. 

• Fear of coarse food, cold fever, dysentery, wounds, danger from thieves, separation from wife 
and children etc. 

• There will be physical distress. 

SATURN – VENUS 

Effects of Antar Dasha of Venus Maha Dasha of Saturn 

• Both auspicious and inauspicious fruits are attained. 
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• Fame in the village or country, wife, children, ornaments and wealth are attained. 

• Happiness from agriculture, affection towards friends and love for the people, bliss from son, 
destruction of enemies and enlightenment due to fame is possible 

• Effects like marriage, birth of a son, gain of wealth, sound health, well being in the family. 
• Acquisition of a kingdom ( attainment of high position in government), enjoyment by the 

beneficence of the king ( government), honours 
• Gain of clothes, ornaments, conveyance and other desired objects. 

• If during the period of Antar Dasha of Venus, Jupiter is favourable in transit, there will be dawn 
fortune and growth of property. 

• If Saturn is favourable in transit, there will be Raj Yog effect or the accomplishment of Yog rites 
(‘Yog Triya Siddhi’). 

• Distress of wife, loss of position, mental agony, quarrels with close relations, etc. 

• Fulfillment of ambitions by the beneficence of the king, charities, performance of religious rites, 
creation of interest in the study of Shastras, composition of poems, interest in Vedanta, etc., 
listening to Puranas, happiness from wife and children. 

• There will be eye trouble, fevers, loss of good conduct, dental problems, heart disease, pain in 
arms, danger from drowning or falling from at tree, antagonism towards relations, with the 
officials of government and brothers. 

• There will be physical distress 

SATURN – SUN 

Effects of Antar Dasha of Sun Maha Dasha of Saturn 

• There is possibility of physical pain and mental agon 

• Indefinite circumstances, sudden events, public criticism and defame are possible. 

• There may be pain to wife, son and friends, enemies may be created and one may have to 
wander uselessly 

• There may be a loss of wealth, pain due to thieves and king and ailments related to appetite, 
heart and eyes. 

• Effects like good relations with one’s employer, well being in the family, happiness from 
children, gain of conveyances and cattle, etc. 

DR.R
UPN

AT
HJI(

 D
R.R

UPA
K 

NAT
H )



 

• There will be heart disease, defamation, loss of position, mental agony, separation from close 
relatives, obstacles in industrial ventures, fevers, fears loss of kinsmen, loss of articles dear to 
the person. 

• There will be physical distress 

SATURN – MOON 

Effects of Antar Dasha of Moon Maha Dasha of Saturn 

• Lack of enthusiasm, mental agony, anger and outrage may increase. 

• There may be disagreements with friends, constant conflicts, hardships due to children and 
harm caused by hidden enemies. 

• Wife may expire or separate or may suffer pain equivalent to death. Happiness may be 
disturbed. 

• Gastric problems or venereal diseases may cause pain. 

• Effects like gains of conveyance, garments, ornaments, improvement of fortune and 
enjoyments, taking care of brothers, happiness in both maternal and paternal homes increase in 
cattle wealth, etc. 

• There will be great distress, wrath, separation from parents, ill health of children, losses in 
business, irregular meals, administration of medicines. 

• There will , however be good effects and some gain of wealth at the commencement of the 
Antar Dasha. 

• Enjoyment of conveyances and garments, happiness from kinsmen, happiness from parents, 
wife, employers, etc. 

• Effects like sleepiness, lethargy, loss of position, loss of enjoyments, increase in the number of 
enemies, antagonism with kinsmen, will be experienced. 

• There will be lethargy and physical distress. 

SATURN – MARS 

Effects of Antar Dasha of Mars Maha Dasha of Saturn 

• The body may suffer pain due to some serious ailments. 

• Brothers may be in pain, friends may be jealous, wife and son may be separated and pain due to 
children may occur. 
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• There may be loss of position, demotion, losses in business and work or ordinary gains. 

• Fear of many types may prevail and friends and status may be harmed. 

• Effects like enjoyments, gain of wealth, reverence from the king (government), gain of 
conveyances, clothes a ornaments, attainment of the position of a commander of the Army, 
increase in agricultural and cattle wealth, construction of a new house, happiness of kinsmen, 
will be derived from the very commencement of the Antar Dasha of Mars in the Dasha Saturn. 

• There will be loss of wealth, danger of wounds, danger from thieves, snakes, weapons, gout and 
other similar disease, distress to father and brothers, quarrels with co-partners, loss of kinsmen, 
coarse food, going away to foreign lands, unnecessary expenditure etc. 

Great distress, dependence on others and fear. 

SATURN – RAHU 

Effects of Antar Dasha of Rahu Maha Dasha of Saturn 

• Inspite of excessive effort and struggle, gains may be very little. 

• There may be shortage of mental enthusiasm and anxiety related to worldly comforts. 

• Quarrels with friends, pain due to enemies and unhappiness due to friends may be possible. 

• Physical ailments like gastric attacks, fever etc. are possible. 

• Effects like quarrels, mental agony, physical distress, agony, antagonism with the sons, danger 
from diseases, unnecessary expenditure, discord with close relations, danger from the 
government, foreign journeys, loss of house and agricultural lands. 

• Enjoyment, gain of wealth, increase in agricultural production, devotion in deities and Brahmins, 
pilgrimage to holy places, increase in cattle wealth, and well-being in the family will be the 
results at the commencement of the Antar Dasha. 

• There will be cordiality with the king and happiness from friends in the middle portion of the 
Antar Dasha. 

• There will be acquisition of elephants, opulence, and glory, cordial relations with the king 
(government), gain of valuable clothes. 

• There will be physical distress. 

SATURN – JUPITER 

Effect of the Antar Dasha of Jupiter in the Maha Dasha of Saturn 
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• Devotion towards God, elders and saints may increase. 

• Wealth, land, vehicles and servants may be attained due to the kings favor. 

• New work may be started, wealth may be attained and fame may be enhanced. 

• Bliss of wife and son prevails, happiness, pleasure and other comforts may be enjoyed. 

• Skill at arts and increase in talents and good habits is foreseen. 

• Effects like success all round, well being in the family, gain of conveyances, ornaments, and 
clothes by the beneficence of the king (government), reverence, devotion of deities and the 
preceptor, association with men of learning, happiness from wife and children, etc. 

• Results like death of the near relations, loss of wealth, antagonism with the government 
officials, failure of projects, journeys to foreign lands, affliction with disease like leprosy, etc. 

• There will be opulence and glory, happiness to wife, gains through the king (government), 
comforts of good food and clothes, religious mindedness, name and fame in the country, 
interest in Vedas and Vedanta, performance of religious sacrifices, giving grains, etc. in charity. 

• Antagonism with kinsmen, mental agony, quarrels loss of position, losses in ventures, loss of 
wealth as a result of imposition of fines or penalties by government imprisonment distress to 
wife and son. 

· There will be physical distress, agony, death of the native or any member of the family 
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